Palatine Park District
Portable Toilet Services - February 3, 2023 - 10:30 a.m.
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Lakeshore Service Waste

Recycling Sanitation Management
Contractor Certifications V V No Bid
Bid Bond v v No Bid
ltem 1
Twelve (12) Month Duration S 4,320.00 4,986.00 No Bid
Iltem 2
Nine (9) Month Duration S 2,380.00 2,326.50 No Bid
Iltem 3
Seven (7) Month Duration $ 20,300.00 22,274.00 No Bid
Iltem 4
Four (4) Month Duration S 4,060.00 4,094.00 No Bid
TOTAL BASE BID $ 31,060.00 33,680.50 No Bid
Event requests - ADA units;
price per unit S 100.00 125.00 No Bid
Event requests - Standard units;
price per unit S 60.00 90.00 No Bid
Event requests - Handwashing stations; price
per unit S 60.00 90.00 No Bid
Even requests - Additional servicing; price per
unit S 18.00 22.50 No Bid
Optional Renewal: Second term increase 0% 3% No Bid
Optional Renewal — Third term increase 2% 3% No Bid




